

## BID TABULATION

*BID # 2020-31  
FILE ID #207-2020*

**BID** ANNUAL SUPPLY OF GARBAGE CONTAINERS AND PARTS

**DATE OPENED** AUGUST 4, 2020

**FINAL ACTION** AUGUST 19, 2020

**BUDGETED** PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT/SOLID WASTE/GARBAGE DIVISION

<u>ITEM</u>	<u>EST QTY</u>	<u>UOM</u>	<u>OTTO ENVIRONMENTAL SYSTEMS (NC), LLC</u>		<u>TOTER, INC.</u>		<u>KART-MAN</u>		<u>REHRIG PACIFIC COMPANY</u>	
			<u>UNIT PRICE</u>	<u>TOTAL PRICE</u>	<u>UNIT PRICE</u>	<u>TOTAL PRICE</u>	<u>UNIT PRICE</u>	<u>TOTAL PRICE</u>	<u>UNIT PRICE</u>	<u>TOTAL PRICE</u>
1 GARBAGE CONTAINER	1,764	EACH	47.49	83,772.36	46.09	81,302.76	no bid	0.00	no bid	0.00
2 WHEEL	4,000	EACH	3.00	12,000.00	4.51	18,040.00	6.50	26,000.00	no bid	0.00
3 CAP	4,000	EACH	N/A		0.20	800.00	0.35	1,400.00	no bid	0.00
4 AXLE	344	EACH	3.00	1,032.00	4.47	1,537.68	6.25	2,150.00	no bid	0.00
5 LID	1,200	EACH	11.00	13,200.00	16.52	19,824.00	no bid	0.00	no bid	0.00
6 SPACER	2,000	EACH	N/A		N/A-do not require spacers		0.04	80.00	no bid	0.00
<b>TOTAL BID</b>			<b>110,004.36</b>		<b>121,504.44</b>		<b>29,630.00</b>		<b>0.00</b>	