

BID TABULATION

BID # 2021-06

FILE ID # 338-2020

BID	<u>ANNUAL SUPPLY OF PUBLIC SAFETY UNIFORMS</u>
DATE OPENED	<u>MARCH 2, 2021</u>
FINAL ACTION	<u>MARCH 17, 2021</u>
BUDGETED	<u>LAKE CHARLES FIRE AND POLICE DEPARTMENTS</u>

FIRMS SUBMITTING BID		BASE BID	BASE BID	
VENDOR:	ACADIAN PROMOTIONAL PRODUCTS	1) 543.97	8) 677.36	
	ATTN: KITTY	2) 103.00	9) 378.94	
	3710 COMMON STREET	3) 20.95	10) 140.19	
	LAKE CHARLES, LA 70607	4) 442.49		
	FAX # 337-480-1946	5) 65.99		
DELIVERY	AS	6) 159.96		
BY	NEEDED	7) 59.98		
	PHONE # 337-480-1945			
	kitty@acadianpromo.net			
VENDOR:	BARNEY'S FIREARM	1) NO BID	8) 661.13	
	ATTN: JULIE ROSE	2) NO BID	9) NO BID	
	218 FOUR PARK ROAD	3) NO BID	10) 121.40	
	LAFAYETTE, LA 70507	4) 439.14		
	FAX # 337-896-3660	5) NO BID		
DELIVERY	AS	6) 136.72		
BY	NEEDED	7) 43.06		
	PHONE # 337-896-3667			
	julie@mycopshop.com			